From: Bruce Ross <bruceross@wi.rr.com>

Subject: Fwd: 3M Foundation Volunteer Match - Payment Sent
Date: August 18, 2021 at 8:10:40 PM CDT

To: Bruce Urben <burben@netnet.net>

Just FYI. This is some of the education stuff that ha been happening out in PDC really with very little
awareness.... but we should be touting (and supporting it). WRT to supporting, they (PDC) have been
getting a $500 grant through us from 3M to support this activity.

Bruce

Begin forwarded message:

From: Matthew Martin <martinmatts71@gmail.com>

Subject: Fwd: FW: Re: 3M Foundation Volunteer Match - Payment Sent

Date: August 17, 2021 at 3:34:49 PM CDT
To: Bruce Ross <bruceross@wi.rr.com>, mdpettit@mmm.com

Bruce,

See attached for some past articles (submitted to our local newspaper) for info on our annual youth
hunt co-sponsored by WWA. In the past, | have sent them to Kelcy for addition in the WWA newsletter,
but | think | forgot to include her for a couple of years.

We try to find young hunters that are interested in Waterfowl Hunting but do not have
waterfowl hunters in their family to take them.

This year will be our 10th year. | also included an itinerary from last year to illustrate what we do for
each group.

From: Bruce Ross <bruceross@wi.rr.com>

Sent: Tuesday, August 17, 2021 11:49 AM

To: Michael Pettit <mdpettit@mmm.com>

Cc: Kelcy M. Boettcher <kelcy@centurytel.net>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: 3M Foundation Volunteer Match - Payment Sent

Mike,
Thanks for the call. Look forward to the material that Matt will be sending, and | even more look
forward to how we can collaborate together on education, habitat and advocacy issues that should be

the foundation of WWA is doing in the PDC community (i.e., beyond fundraising!)

Bruce
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On Aug 17, 2021, at 8:06 AM, Bruce Ross <bruceross@wi.rr.com> wrote:

Hi Mark,
Would love to discuss this effort with you. Since I've been in this role for 2-1/2 years, I've heard
about your work and would like to better understand it and how we might be able to leverage it for

the good of the states waterfowlers. Is there a good time to speak this week? Thanks for your
consideration.

Bruce

Bruce Ross
WWA Executive Director

262.224.4949 (w)

From: Michael Pettit <mdpettit@mmm.com>

Sent: Tuesday, August 17, 2021 6:50 AM

To: kelcy@centurytel.net

Subject: FW: 3M Foundation Volunteer Match - Payment Sent

Kelcy, any way you can transfer this Volunteer Match to our WWA checking account so we can use the
funds for our WWA Youth Hunt this year?

Thanks!

Mike
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Michael D. Pettit CSP | EHS Specialist/Supervisor

3M Prairie du Chien

801 N Marquette Road | Prairie du Chien, WI 53821 | United States
Office: +1 608 326 3060 | Mobile: +1 608 379 4416
mdpettit@mmm.com
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From: matchinggifts@mmm.com <matchinggifts@mmm.com>

Sent: Friday, July 23, 2021 9:28 AM

To: Michael Pettit <mdpettit@mmm.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] 3M Foundation Volunteer Match - Payment Sent

Dear Michael Pettit,

A 3M Foundation payment has been sent to WISCONSIN WATERFOWL ASSOCIATION INC in the
amount of $500.00 in recognition of your participation in the 3M Foundation Volunteer Match
program.

Organization: WISCONSIN WATERFOWL ASSOCIATION INC
Hours Volunteered: 32

Volunteer Start Date: 02-JUL-2021

Gift Designation*:

Match Amount**: $500.00
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To view your giving history, cancel or make changes to current donations, enter new gifts, review
your volunteer hours, or track the status of your match, log in to the My 3Mgives tool.

e If connected to the 3M network, follow this link: My 3Mgives
e If not connected to the 3M network, go to www.3Mgives.com/match and click on "Login -
Outside 3M Network"

Still have questions? No problem! Please contact 3M Foundation by replying directly to this email or
contacting 3msupport@cybergrants.com.

We appreciate your commitment to improving lives!

Regards,

3M Foundation

3M Center

St. Paul, MN 55144
www.3M.com/3MFoundation

Please Note: 3M Foundation may modify, suspend or terminate this program at any time. 3M
Foundation interprets program guidelines and administers the program under policies established by
the 3M Foundation Board. All grants and payments are subject to program guidelines and 3M
Foundation's terms and conditions. To learn more visit www.3M.com/3MFoundation.

CG/IMAIL/213273735
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